
Application Related Information

    Application: Application Verified Iteration Name: 202510_GR_G

   Grad Program Applying To: MPA Program Name: MPA

Recommendation Information

    Recommended By: Roxanne Hockett Recommenders Title: Grants Director

    Recommenders Institution: PGST Contact Name: Justyn Purser

    
Waive Access to

Recommendation Ltrs:
I choose to waive my right to
review this recommendation.

Recommendation Waiver
Choice:

I choose to waive my right to
review this recommendation.

    Recommendation Form
Submitted:

Recommendation Status: Received

    Received Date: 01/31/2024 04:37 PM Recommender Assessment: I recommend this applicant.

    
Recommendation Type:

General
Recommender Form: MPA Letter of

Recommendation/Form

   Recommendation Entity ID: 1024000117503782 Recommendation Owner: Josephine Bernier

Recommender Form Questions

    

How long have you known
applicant:

5 years

Applicant ability as
self-directed learner:

I have witnessed Justyn's
desire to learn in his current
position of Grant Writer for
Port Gamble S'Klallam Tribe.
He is motivated, sets clear
goals, and committed to
pursuing those goals. He uses
his time wisely and stays
organized. He requires very
little guidance but has no
problem asking questions. He
is resourceful.

    

Time since last contact with
applicant:

Today

Applicant as productive
member of group:

Justyn's current job as Grant
Writer requires him to work in
group settings in order to
accomplish many tasks daily.
His communication is clear
and he is an active listener.
He is respectful, contributes
thoughtfully, and takes
initiative. He meets deadlines,
identifies challenges and
collaborates with others to
overcome obstacles. I can
rely on his leadership to
motivate others or guide the
group towards achieving
common goals.



    

Relationship with Applicant:

Current Supervisor

Applicant most significant
strengths:

Justyn's most significant and
relevant strengths are his
technical skills,
communication skills, and
collaboration and teamwork.
He is proficient in
technology/computer
navigation as well as
Microsoft suite. His written
and oral communication is
excellent which leads to
productive interactions. He is
an active participant in our
team, always willing to
contribute ideas, able to build
positive relationships, and he
is able to adapt to changing
circumstances.

    Ability to complete rigourous
grad program:

Excellent Responsibility/reliability: Excellent

    Communication Skills - Oral: Excellent Communication skills -
written:

Excellent

    Service
Orientation-sensitivity/empathy:

Excellent Ability to work independently: Outstanding

    Ability to handle stress: Very Good Ability to think critically: Excellent

    Ability to analyze/problem
solve:

Very Good Ability to think creatively: Excellent

    Openness to feedback: Outstanding Potential for leadership: Excellent

   Ability to work in a team: Outstanding Personal/professional
reflection:

Excellent

Description Information

   Description: Form URL: https://evergreenstatecollege.radiusbycampusmgmt.com/ssc/rform/Bd787c0Gc021x6700oB00l.ssc
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